
My dear god parents,  
 
I hope this letter find you well.  
 
First of all, I hope the eagles can send the best blessings from your 
god daughter in a faraway place, and that you are all healthy, 
smooth with your work, and also hope that my sisters, Maurie and 
Kim, make progress on their study, and more and more beautiful. 
Now I would like to tell you about myself.  
 
I am very fine here in school. I don’t feel much pressure in study 
now. I miss you very much. I want to see you. I am in the last year 
for my senior middle school as my sister Maurie. If I hadn’t got the 
help from you, my dear god parents, I wouldn’t have stayed in the 
bright and cozy classroom to enjoy knowledge. I am very grateful 
for the help, support and concerns of my dear god parents. I want 
to thank God for giving me such kind god parents. I am very 
grateful! In the last year of my senior middle school, I must cherish 
every minute to study harder in order to go to a good college and 
make chance to see my dear god parents as soon as possible. I hope 
I can realize these two goals, so I must study hard. I learned that 
Sister Maurie like dance very much. I think that must be very 
interesting. I like dance, too. But I don’t have chance to major in 
this profession because of the poverty of my family. My favorite 
subjects are Tibetan, English and Chinese. My other favorites are 
running, dancing, singing and reading, and my favorite colors are 
white, black, azure and pink. I am 18 years old this year. I was 
born on April 2, 1992, height: 165 cm.  
 
Oh, dear god parents, in the last exams, I was ranked the 2nd in my 
class. The problem I still math. I don’t know how to learn math 
well. No matter how hard I learn on it, it is still hard for me to 
understand well. I learned that Maurie is not very good at math, is 
that right? Ai, how can I learn math well? It is a little confusing. 
Anyway, I will never give in, and I will do my best to learn every 



subject well. Sister Maurie, let’s work hard together! 
 
I have to stop here! Talk to you next time! 
 
Your god daughter: Silang Qucuo  
Class Two, Grade Three of Senior Middle School  
Sept 1, 09 








